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Set up a “Green Team” to
lead environmental

initiatives.

Support local businesses
that are environmentally

conscious.

AprilApril
Environmental Responsibility

Work: Kindness Calendar 

Initiate a recycling program
for paper, plastic, and glass.

Organize a neighborhood-
wide clean-up day.

Create a community
garden and grow local

plants or vegetables

Set up compost bins
forfood waste

Implement a “no- idling”
policy.

Encourage reusable water
bottles and ban single-use

plastics.

Initiate a carpool program to
lower carbon emissions.

Share the ABOH calendars
with your friends.

Consider planting trees or
native plants throughout

the school grounds.

Organize a clothing swap
event to encourage the

reuse of items.

Conduct a waste audit
to understand and
reduce workplace

waste.

Promote “Bike or Walk to
Work” days.

Use environmentally
friendly school cleaning

supplies.

Organize a donation drive
for books or supplies to

minimize waste.

Enforce a lights-off policy
for unused rooms.

Just breathe. Promote digital
assignments to minimize

paper usage.

Conduct workshops on
upcycling and creatively

reusing materials.

Be grateful for the little
things.

Eat more sustainable
foods.

Make Earth a Kinder Place:
Join ABOH! Set up a seed exchange

program for your workplace

Plan a "Green Fair" to
highlight sustainable

practices.

Promote safe disposal of
hazardous materials,

such as batteries.

Install energy-efficient
lighting and appliances.

Transform and Upcycle!
Offer incentives for eco-

friendly behaviors like using
public transit.

Partner with local
environmental

organizations for resources
and support.
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